
 

Our Analysis Process 
 

We are dedicated to using trusted intelligence-based services to provide a 
competitive edge to our partners and strengthen national security. Our analysis 
services encompass a wide range of areas, including All-Source Intelligence, 
Planning, Programming, Budgeting, Execution (PPBE), Readiness Analysis, Foreign 
Investment (CFIUS), Adversary Capital, and Cyber Security Management. To 
effectively deliver these services to support multiple offices in the United States 
Government, Department of Defense, Department of Homeland Security, 
intelligence community, and commercial enterprises worldwide, we employ a 
systematic and efficient analysis process. 

 

 

 

1. Requirement Identification 

The analysis process starts with identifying the specific requirements of our partners 
and stakeholders. This involves understanding the objectives, priorities, and 
challenges faced by the client, as well as the relevant regulatory or security 
considerations. 



 

2. Data Collection and Integration 

Once the requirements are defined, our team gathers data from a variety of sources, 
including open-source intelligence, classified information, and proprietary 
databases. This data is then integrated to provide a comprehensive and holistic view 
of the situation. 

 

3. Analysis Framework Development 

We develop a tailored analysis framework based on the specific requirements of the 
project. This framework outlines the methodologies, tools, and techniques that will 
be utilized to conduct the analysis and derive actionable insights. 

 

4. Data Analysis and Interpretation 

Our team of experienced analysts conducts a rigorous analysis of the integrated data 
using advanced analytical tools and techniques. This process involves identifying 
patterns, trends, anomalies, and relationships to extract meaningful conclusions. 

 

5. Collaborative Review and Validation 

The analysis is reviewed collaboratively by a team of subject matter experts to 
validate the findings and ensure accuracy and relevance. This step enables us to 
refine the analysis and incorporate additional insights from diverse perspectives. 

 

6. Report Generation and Presentation 

Based on the validated analysis, a comprehensive report is generated, outlining the 
key findings, recommendations, and actionable insights. This report is presented to 
the client in a clear and concise manner, tailored to their specific needs and 
preferences. 

 

7. Feedback and Iteration 



We encourage feedback from the client to refine and iterate on the analysis process 
continually. This iterative approach ensures that our analysis remains relevant, 
accurate, and actionable in addressing the evolving needs of our partners. 

 

By following this systematic analysis process, Sourceree ensures the delivery of high-
quality intelligence-based services that provide a competitive edge to our partners 
and contribute to strengthening National Security. 


